
November Challenge Kits  consisted of  the items
needed to make your own DIY Beaded Flint  Corn.

Open to ALL Harrison County community
members!  First  three to  complete the challenge

get  a  prize!  Limited quantities  available,  so  stop
by the Extension Office Monday-Friday from 8am-

4:30pm to pick yours up!

CHALLENGE KITS

NOVEMBER

DIY BEADED FLINT CORN



EXTENSION CHALLENGE KITS

WHAT: What is an Extension Challenge Kit?  Our monthly
challenge kits provide instructions and most materials to do a
DIY educational project or two on your own.  The kits are
geared towards ALL Harrison County community members,
and focus on Extension education areas such as Agriculture
and Natural Resources or Health and Human Sciences.  Our
kits are FREE, but come in limited quantities so be sure to
check in with us at the first of each month.

WHEN:  We release our challenge kits at the beginning of
each month in the Extension Office.  You can come in
Monday-Friday 8:00am-4:30pm to pick yours up in person.  
Check our Facebook for information at the first of each month
regarding challenge details, and feel free to call the office to
see if kits are still available (limited quantities).

WHY:  Our kits are a way for us to provide outreach and
engage with Harrison County community members, by
supplying a hands-on, project-based learning opportunity to be
explored on your own.  Many of our challenge kits can also be
turned into projects to be submitted at the fair.  Each month
we have a prize for the first three completed challenges
submitted. We’d love to see your completed projects in-person
at the office, or you can submit your photos or videos via email
to camm@purdue.edu or tdbeckma@purdue.edu or on our
Facebook page by commenting on the pinned Challenge Kit
post at the top of the page. 
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EXTENSION CHALLENGE KITS

IDEAS: Do you have ideas for future Challenges-- maybe an
area of interest you’d like to explore? Our challenge kits have
been evolving over the past year and we would love to hear
your wonderful ideas and input.  Please reach out to our office
via contact info below if you have a great idea for a future
challenge kit.  Kits we have done in the past include topics
such as: Sewing, Apple Culinary, Pumpkin STEM, Salt Dough
Ornament, Snowflake Crystals, Heart Health Model, Wildlife
Birdfeeders, Egg Rockets, Planting Seeds of Hope, Butterfly
Life Cycle, Produce Puffy Paint, Let’s Go Fishing, Literacy
Bingo, Pumpkin Slime and Volcano.

SPONSORSHIP: Would you like to support our Extension
Challenge Kits by helping us provide supplies to make these
challenges possible?  We are looking for sponsors as we work
to grow and expand our reach and efforts.  Each month we
currently provide 20 kits, with an estimated cost of supplies at
$2.00 per kit.  We would love to further extend the challenge
to the Harrison County community with your help.  Please let
us know if you would like to be a sponsor by contacting us via
the information below.
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